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Show your home: Luxury Nashville home
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Valley area
Rebecca Treon Special to Nashville Tennessean
Published 5:08 a.m. CT June 12, 2024 Updated 5:08 a.m. CT June 12, 2024

Located in the Seven Hills subdivision of the Burton Valley area, the four story, 8,436-
square-foot home at 4613 General Lowrey Drive has five bedrooms, seven full and one half
bathrooms and plenty of space for recreation, exercising and even wine-tasting.

Purchased by the current owners as a new construction in 2016, it has the elegance of a turn
of the century farmhouse but with all the bells and whistles of a luxury estate.

“The luxurious upgrades the owners have added with love and care set it apart from the
standard in new construction,” says Patricia Rappa Robbe, the home’s listing agent. “The
attention to state of the art comfort and practicality go beyond what you see in most homes.”

The home is currently listed for $3.975 million.

Complete with mature trees, the 1-plus-acre property is surrounded by white crossbuck
fencing reminiscent of an equestrian estate, yet it is just minutes from shopping, restaurants
and hospitals. The home’s spacious front porch, buttery white paint and dramatic dormer
windows that flank the second story and define the third story of the home create an inviting
vignette.

A flagstone pathway leading to a flared staircase invites visitors to Craftsman-style double
doors with a transom window that’s duplicated on the other front windows of the home.

In the entryway, wood floors shine, leading upstairs or through to the rest of the house. To
the immediate left, the formal dining room offers plenty of natural light and leads into the
kitchen, while straight through the foyer down the hall, there's a second entrance the kitchen,
making a horseshoe.
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The all-white kitchen is ideal for the gourmand. It features an enormous double
fridge/freezer, a gas range with two separate ovens and an island with bar seating, built-in
beverage refrigerator and wine storage. There’s ample space inside white floor to ceiling
cabinets with a wainscotting finish and stainless hardware that compliment the stainless
appliances and the gray threads snaking through the Carerra marble countertops. There’s
also a huge walk-in pantry and a breakfast nook with a huge picture window overlooking the
back deck and the yard beyond.

Off the kitchen, there’s a spacious living room, anchored by a cozy gas fireplace whose mantel
adds a traditional element to the space with fluted legs and tiered molding, while the dark
paint on the wall behind adds drama.

Two recessed areas have built-in cabinets with wainscotting, while recessed can lighting
makes it the ideal place for movie night. All along one wall, glass accordion doors open into
the sunroom. Surrounded by windows and with access to the patio, it also features a gas
fireplace and a second informal dining space. The enclosed sunroom is ideal for winter
months and acts almost as a private sitting room to the main floor primary suite.
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The primary suite is light-filled, with picture windows overlooking the back patio, crown
molding, neutral walls, plantation shutters and wood floors. The primary suite has an
oversized ensuite bathroom with traditional white cabinetry, marble floors, counter tops, and
shower tiles, and a dual sink vanity with sconce lighting. Through the bath, a spacious
dressing room has built-in dressers and shelving.

The home has two offices, one on the ground floor and one on the second floor, that could
easily be used as bedrooms. It also has six additional full bathrooms each outfitted in whites,
grays and neutrals, some with vanity cabinets or pedestal sinks, with shower stalls or a
bathtub. Each bedroom has its own ensuite, plus there are two additional full bathrooms.
There’s also an additional half bath.

Upstairs, there is a full living room space that anchors the surrounding four bedrooms with
French doors leading to a sunroom that’s among the eaves of the roof. Though it’s light-filled
with a view of the treetops, its best feature is the seating that’s suspended from the ceiling by
ropes.
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There are four additional bedrooms tucked into the dormer windows, each well-lit and
spacious. There’s an additional rec room and craft space that adds livability to the upstairs
area.

Downstairs on the basement level, there’s a fully finished living space that could be used for
entertainment or as a mother-in-law suite. It has a home theater with a retractable screen
and plenty of space for games or lounge furniture. Right now it’s part of the wine tasting and
storage room. The space also has an additional full kitchen, outfitted with blue cabinets, a
stovetop, microwave, range, dishwasher and fridge. It’s ideal for entertaining or for multi-
generational living. The home even has elevator capabilities, but it just needs installation.

The basement is also outfitted with a wine cave. Not only does the cave has plenty of racks for
storing wine, but it even has a tasting sink. The basement has an exercise room that could be
converted into a bedroom, along with a full bathroom. The property has a large storage space
plus a four-car garage, a carport and driveway parking.

Outside, the home’s main level has a spacious back deck that overlooks the lawn and a split
staircase leading to the lawn. On the ground level, a flagstone path leads to a circular stone
patio that would be ideal for a fireside gathering, plus there’s a water feature for added
serenity. The yard has plenty of space for a pool, if desired. The property is surrounded by a
line of mature trees that add seclusion and privacy.


